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Service Summary

Family to do services at later date

Visitation
3:00 PM to 9:00 PM, Thu Dec 22, 2016

G. J. Gonce Funeral Home, P.A.
169 Riviera Drive
Pasadena, MD 21122

Obituary

Born: Monday, December 29, 1980
Died: Tuesday, December 13, 2016

Lisa Marie Link, age 35, a resident of Glen Burnie for 5 years
and previously of Baltimore, passed on December 13, 2016 at
Baltimore Washington Medical Center.

She was born on December 29, 1980, in Baltimore, to
Kimberly and Kenneth Link. After graduating from Seton
Keough High School in 1998, she continued her education
for 2 years at Catonsville Community College. She has
worked for the City of Baltimore Recreation and Parks
Service, and also for United Cerebral Palsy. She enjoyed
reading, camping, doing crafts and baking with her girls.
Lisa's hobbies were always centered around anything her
girls wanted to do.

She is preceded in death by her grandparents: Dorothy M.
Manning and William S. Abbott; and Rosie "Lee" and James
M. Frome.

Along with her parents Kimberly and Kenneth, Lisa is
survived by her dear partner of 20 years: Rodney Romey; and
her three daughters: Kayla, Reagan, and Skylar Romey, all of
Glen Burnie.

Family requests friends visit at the Gregory J. Gonce Funeral
Home, PA, 169 Riviera Drive, Pasadena, 21122 on Thursday
from 3 to 9 PM. Feel free to express your condolences below
as well. Her memorial service will be held at a later date.
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